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If Josef Stalin, Vladimir Lenin or Chairman Mao had dictated America's 
national security policy for the last 50 years, they could not have done a 
better job of subverting America than the New Communist Party of the 
USA -- wrongly called the "Democrat" Party -- has done without their 
direct involvement. Yet, most Americans remain oblivious to this 
because of the treachery of our corrupt and dishonest Jews' Media. 
 
In Desert Storm, the U.S. achieved the most lopsided victory in the 
history of warfare.  Placing a REAL General like Norman Schwarzkopf in 
charge was key to that victory, but he was also given the essential 
weaponry to achieve it.  Each of the state-of-the-art weapon systems 
that permitted such a one-sided victory over Iraq had been earlier 
cancelled by the Carter Administration, but later rescued and funded by  
Reagan's Administration.  Among these were the Abrams Tank, the 
Tomahawk Cruise Missile, the B-2 Bomber, the TOW anti-tank weapon, 
and the Stinger anti-aircraft weapon.  
 

 

 

 
 

Abrams Tank, B-2 Bomber & Tomahawk Cruise Missile 



While the Carter Administration was mindlessly cancelling weapons 
systems in the late 1970s, it DID manage to approve the sale of state-of-
the-art Bryant Centalign-B precision ball-bearing grinders to the Soviet 
Union.  These miracles of American engineering produced ball-bearings 
with tolerances of 27 ten-millionths of an inch (.0000027 inches,) and 
were purchased by the USSR solely to enhance the accuracy of the 
warheads on their Inter-Continental Ballistic Missiles (ICBMs) aimed at 
U.S. cities.  As a result, Soviet ICBMs were soon as accurate as our own.  
Prior to Carter, the Soviets had more ICBMs with more warheads, but 
our warheads were far more accurate.  This was no longer the case after 
the Carter Administration approved this sale, and thereby shifted the 
"balance of terror" in favor of the USSR. 
 
Likewise, Jimmy Carter and a "Democrat" Senate surrendered the 
Panama Canal Zone to the Nation of Panama in 1979, even though 
America expended enormous blood and treasure to build it.  Arguably, 
the Canal Zone has greater strategic significance than any other 
geographic entity in the Western Hemisphere, since two-thirds of all 
shipping to or from the U.S. pass through its locks each day.  China now 
effectively controls the Canal Zone after making itself indispensable to 
Panama through its "Belt and Road Initiative," which funds infrastructure 
projects in many Third World nations.  The Canal Zone has become the 
potential "flashpoint" that opponents of the Panama Canal Treaty had 
earlier predicted in the 1970s. 
 

 

 
Panama Canal 



For some reason, the NCPUSA has a penchant for subsidizing our mortal 
enemies by bailing out their failing economies, such as that of the USSR 
in the 1970s. This was alleged to be beneficial because it supposedly 
demonstrated our benevolent and peaceful intentions toward the 
Soviets, and was often couched in terms of making democratic and 
capitalist allies out of our ideological enemies.  This delusional approach 
to foreign policy is often referred to as "mirroring," and implies that 
totalitarian dictators have similar motivations and goals as Westerners.  
In reality, U.S. loans and “trade credits” to the Soviet Union in the 1970s 
allowed the USSR to divert resources from its agricultural and consumer 
goods sectors, and then fund the largest and most aggressively 
expansionist military in modern history.  

After the Soviets invaded Afghanistan in 1979, they murdered its central 
government and installed a puppet regime friendly to Moscow.  The 
timid and rudderless Carter Administration did nothing, signaling its 
weakness much like the Biden Administration did by not responding to  
Russia's invasion of the Ukraine in 2022. (Somehow, Russia's nuclear 
arsenal effectively deterred the Carter, Obama and Biden 
Administrations from confronting Russia, but our own nuclear arsenal 
never seems to deter Russian aggression.)  The Soviets occupied 
Afghanistan for 10 years, but were eventually driven out only because 
the Reagan Administration armed Afghanistan's goat-herders with state-
of-the-art Stinger surface-to-air-missiles (SAMs,) and Javelin anti-tank 
weapons that generated MASSIVE and UNSUSTAINABLE losses for the 
Soviet occupiers.     
 
From the very beginning of his administration, Jimmy Carter sought to 
pass the second Strategic Arms Limitation Treaty or SALT TWO.  Its 
adoption was vigorously pursued and relentlessly negotiated, even 
though the Soviets had previously violated every provision of every 
treaty it entered into in the 20th Century except the Hitler-Stalin Pact.  
The SALT ONE Treaty was an obvious example:  the USSR installed ICBM 



radar systems, it upgraded "light" missiles into "heavy" missiles, and it 
added additional warheads to its ICBMs, all in violation of specific 
provisions of SALT ONE.  Clearly, the Soviets used our observance of the 
self-limiting provisions of SALT ONE to gain an advantage over the U.S. 
in terms of the balance-of-terror.  Yet, this merely prompted the Carter 
Administration to redouble its efforts to pass SALT TWO by lying and 
denying obvious evidence of Soviet violations of SALT ONE.   
 
The Clinton Administration was limited by Republican majorities in both 
Houses of Congress, but still managed to participate in the NCPUSA's 
tradition of subverting America's national security.  In 1996, Bill Clinton 
personally approved the sale of Loral Space Corporation's state-of-the-
art missile guidance system to communist China.  Because of its national 
security implications, Clinton had to overrule his own State Department, 
FBI, Defense Department and intelligence community (the CFIUS 
Committee) to approve that sale, but it was worth it.  Clinton's reward 
came in the form of a BRIBE from Loral's founder and Chairman, Bernard 
Swartz, and it consisted of a $6 Million contribution to the Democrat 
National Committee to assist in Clinton's 1996 reelection. 
 
 

 
 
 
Obama turned a blind eye to most of the corruption and treason in his 
administration, but some of it he may have helped orchestrate, himself.   
As Obama's Secretary of State, Hillary Clinton sold 20% of America's 



precious Uranium reserves to Russia -- in the so-called "Uranium One 
Deal" -- in return for tens of millions of dollars in bribes from Russian 
Oligarchs to the Clinton Family Crime Foundation.  That Uranium is no 
doubt found in some of those Russian ICBMs aimed at American cities, 
that Vladimir Putin recently referenced in a threatening manner as a 
means of deterring the U.S. from interfering with his invasion and 
subjugation of Ukraine. 

Obama aggressively pursued the "Iran Deal," financially rewarding Iran 
for sponsoring international terrorism over many decades.  It transferred 
to Iran more than $150 Billion in Iranian assets frozen in the Swift System 
of international currency exchanges, and included a "gratuity" in the 
form of $2 Billion in U.S. $100 bills.  In return, the Obama regime received 
vague and unverifiable promises from Iran not to pursue its nuclear 
weapons program, but Iran took the money and continued full-steam 
ahead.  The treaty's real purpose was to empower Obama's fellow 
Moslems.  It was also considered useful in creating the illusion of a 
foreign policy "victory" to enhance Obama's image.  Obama's arming of 
Iran in the Iran Deal will continue to generate terrorism and cost 
innocent lives for decades to come in the Middle East.  

Likewise, under the Obama Administration, Hunter Biden and his 
partners at Rosemont Seneca Partners received an unprecedented 
windfall of $1.5 Billion from communist China to invest.  In return for its 
generous patronage of Hunter Biden's influence-peddling scheme, 
communist China's government -- through its Aviation Industry 
Corporation of China -- was permitted to purchase Michigan's Henniges 
Automotive, a producer of strategic technologies that reduce engine 
vibrations to enhance the "stealth" features of military equipment.  
Despite the fact that it involved stealth technology with military 
applications -- sold to our mortal enemies -- the sale was approved by 
Barack Hussein Obama, who had to first overrule any objections by 
CFIUS, the Committee on Foreign Investment in the U.S. 



 

Henniges Logo & China's J-20 Stealth Fighter 

 

The Obama Administration also showed its loyalty to Russia when 
Obama refused to assist the Ukraine after Russia invaded it for the first 
time back in 2014.  Instead of sending weapons or deploying forces, 
Obama sent them blankets.  (A guy could be left with the impression 
that Obama felt greater sympathy for the neo-communists in Putin's 
Russia than with the fledgling and non-communist nation of Ukraine.)  

As traitorous and subversive as prior NCPUSA administrations may have 
been, none can rival the Biden Administration for pure treachery.  Under 
Biden, the NCPUSA's domination by communists and crooks has been 
complete and irreversible.  The day he took office, Joe Biden cancelled 
the Keystone XL Pipeline from Canada and forbade oil and gas 
exploration and "fracking" on federal lands, which immediately   
obliterated America's energy independence by harming domestic oil 
production.  Meanwhile, he approved Russia's Nord Stream gas pipeline 
that created Western European (and NATO) dependence on Russian gas.  
 
Biden's arbitrary and capricious actions doubled the worldwide price of 
crude oil in only one year, creating a windfall for Russia's oil and gas 
exports, and dramatically enriching its coffers.  In doing so, Biden also 
helped to fund Russian expansionism, with its brutal and unprovoked 
invasion of the Ukraine since 2022. 



 
 
 
 
Biden demonstrated his weakness and cowardice with his disorderly and 
humiliating 2021 retreat from Afghanistan, abandoning $85 Billion 
worth of state-of-the-art military equipment and hundreds of American 
citizens to the bloodthirsty savages of the Taliban.  With equal treachery, 
he has opened America's southern border and welcomed two million 
illegal aliens into America from 150 different nations without any 
vetting of their criminal histories or their motivations for illegally 
entering the U.S.  (Many will prove to be terrorists.) 
 
Finally, Biden has waffled and vacillated and "led from behind" in 
responding to Russia's unprovoked and brutal invasion of the Ukraine. 
Initially, he relied exclusively on empty rhetoric involving economic 
sanctions when he should have sent Stinger and Javelin defensive 
weapon systems to the Ukraine long before Russia's invasion made them 
more difficult to deliver.  He also practically invited Russia to invade the 
Ukraine's Eastern Provinces when he clumsily attempted to distinguish 
between a full-fledged invasion and a "minor incursion," implying that 
the latter was somehow acceptable to the U.S. and NATO.  Worse yet, 
those economic sanctions were all form over substance because they 
specifically excluded the freezing of Russia's oil and gas revenues 
through the Swift System of international currency transactions.  



 
 

Stinger & Javelin Weapon Systems 
 
 
 
As I've argued many times, the NCPUSA consists of two demonstrably 
treasonous "wings," its organized crime wing and its Marxist wing.  The 
NCPUSA's organized crime wing is dominated by the Clintons and Bidens, 
who are primarily motivated by ill-gotten wealth.  Meanwhile, its Marxist 
wing is dominated by the Obamas and the "squad," who are communist 
ideologues and primarily motivated by the pursuit of power.  Both wings 
are equally willing to assist America's mortal enemies at our own 
expense, particularly Iran, China, the Soviet Union, and the latter nation's 
recent reincarnation as the NEW Soviet Union under Vladimir Putin.  
 
It's quite clear that the NCPUSA has much more affinity for totalitarians 
and Marxists than for fellow Americans who happen to be 
conservative, Republican, Libertarian.  In any case, America and the 
West have routinely been the victims of its treachery.   


