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Tucker Carlson was the first prominent opponent of American aid to the 
Ukraine on his "Tucker Carlson Tonight" show, formerly on Fox News.  
His argument was predicated on Ukraine being one of the most corrupt 
nations on Earth, and that the U.S. was crazy to fund it, even against 
invading Russians.  I rarely disagree with Tucker, but it turns out that he 
was absolutely correct and many of us were quite wrong. 

My epiphany was the recent reportage by Seymour Hersh that Ukrainian 
unit commanders have been selling U.S. weapons on the black market to 
international arms smugglers in Poland and Romania.  These are state-
of-the-art weapon systems -- such as Stinger missiles -- that were 
earmarked for the defense of Ukraine.  Ukraine's traitors are like the 
slime who sold rifles and liquor to Indians during America's Westward 
expansion.  Prior to the allegations by Hersh, reports of disappearing 
arms shipments had periodically been published in some corrupt leftist 
media organs, but received little "traction."   

 

 

Stinger Missile: Shoulder-Fired, Surface-to-Air Missile 



This scandal may explain why Ukrainian President Volodymyr Zelenskyy 
is constantly demanding additional U.S. aid, even though we've already 
contributed $120 Billion to Ukraine's defense.  In August of 2022, CBS 
interviewed the Ukrainian militia leader that founded Blue-Yellow, who  
stated that only about 30% of U.S. military aid had actually reached the 
front lines of battle.  Unfortunately, that CBS documentary -- "Arming 
Ukraine" -- was spiked under pressure from  the very people who got us 
into this mess.   

By then, we already knew from investigations by the Securities and 
Exchange Commission that Ukrainian oligarchs had intercepted billions 
in U.S. financial aid sent to Ukraine.  They then laundered those funds 
through the crooked crypto currency exchange FTX, after which $40 
Million ended up funding "Democrat" candidates for public office in the 
2022 midterms.  It's now patently obvious that U.S. Foreign Aid to 
Ukraine often returns as laundered contributions to either the DNC or 
the Biden Family Crime Syndicate. 

 

 
Democrat $ =>  Ukraine $ =>  FTX  $ =>  Democrats 



Although spiked by the Jews' Media, we also know that corrupt Ukrainian 
officials and businesses transferred millions of dollars to the Biden 
Family Crime Syndicate in order to buy influence with Vice President Joe 
Biden -- "The Big Guy" -- and ensure continued U.S. financial aid to that 
nation.  Hunter Biden alone garnered at least $3 Million in Biden's pay-
to-play influence peddling scheme while Biden was Vice President.  
Author Peter Schweizer correctly stated that Ukraine has been a 
"playground" for the "Democrat" Party for years.   
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Even Russian officials have warned that U.S. weapons were being 
smuggled outside the Ukraine, which eventually ended up "in the hands 
of terrorists, extremists and criminal groups..." These profoundly 
undermine security around the globe because those Stinger missiles can 
reliably shoot-down commercial aircraft at very high altitudes. A 
spokeswoman for Russia's Foreign Ministry estimates the volume of 
illegal U.S. arms being smuggled at about $1 Billion per month.   

Isn't it odd that even the Russians appear more concerned with 
international security conditions than the Biden Administration seems to 
be.  Tucker was right:  the Biden Administration was insane to get 
involved in Ukraine.  A pox upon both their houses. 


